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PUBLIC enterprises have now 
become, in most countries, a 

permanent and important sector of 
national economic life. The nationa­
lisation of public utilities and 
participation in basic and strategic 
industries is not particularly an 
Indian trend; even countries like 
the U.K. and the U.S.A. with highly 
developed economies, have not re­
mained untouched by this new 
development. State enterprises, by 
reason of their public ownership, 
operating often in a monopolistic 
field, have to depend upon popular 
support for their growth and ex­
pansion. Increasingly large invest­
ments of national resources in their 
creation and expansion have also 
developed a continuing public in­
terest in their management and 
control. It is on these considera­
tions that their efficient and eco­
nomic management as also their 
accountability assume considerable 
importance. 

It is now universally recognized 
that rules, regulations and controls 
which are applied to departmental 
activities cannot be satisfactorily 
used in State enterprises. They 
have to be given form and autho­
rity needed, to make it possible for 
them to fulfil the very purposes for 
which they are created. In the 
words of Herbert Morrison: "When 
we come to a highly commercial 
enterprise, we have to get a more 
subtle instrument, more adaptable, 
more capable of quick movement 
and less liable to be bound down 
by tradition and rules." It is on 
these considerations that the 
nationalised industries in the 
United Kingdom were given the 
corporate form and operated on 
business lines with a comparable 
degree of elasticity of control and 

business efficiency as in private 
enterprises. 

Before Independence, State in­
tervention in India's economic 
development was, at best, spas­
modic and fragmentary. An alien 
power did not feel any compelling 
urge to embark on a plan of rapid. 
industrialisation. It rested content 
with the nationalisation of the rail­
ways and participation in the 
equity capital of the Reserve Bank. 
The departmental form of manage­
ment was preserved on the nationa­
lisation of the Railways. While the 
controlling authority, the Railway 
Board, had certain statutory func­
tions, it was nevertheless adminis­
tered as a department of Govern­
ment. It was only after the enunci­
ation of the Industrial Policy Reso­
lution of 1948, that State initiative 
and participation in industrial 
development became a significant 
force and the concept of the 
management of public enterprises 
as autonomous units became an 
ingredient of her economic deve­
lopment. 

The autonomy which is inherent 
in any form of public enterprise 
does not mean an abdication of 
Government's responsibility and 
authority; nor does it mean the 
abrogation of parliamentary con­
trol. The problem is to find syste­
matised and streamlined controls, 
both executive and parliamentary, 
in which the essentials will remain 
and the irritants disappear, in 
which the undertakings will be free 
to function without undue let or 
hindrance, a freedom which will be 
scrupulously honoured so long as 
they function economically and 
efficiently. 



The structure of the State enter­
prise, incorporated as a company, 
does not differ substantially from 
the structure of private enterprises. 
Certain functions and powers have, 
however, been reserved to the Pre­
sident. The power to appoint the 
Directors, including the Chairman 
and the Managing Director, flows 
logically from his status as the sole 
share-holder. The other provisions, 
more particularly, the right to issue 
directives, are inherent in the 
character of a public enterprise as 
an apparatus for the furtherance of 
the State's economic policy. This 
provision is necessary to safeguard 
national interests and to ensure 
that the policy of Government as a 
whole is free from contradictions. 
It is not intended to influence or 
direct day-to-day administration or 
the execution of approved policy. 
Another important reservation is 
the authority conferred on the 
Comptroller and Auditor-General 
to conduct a supplementary or test 
audit and to direct the auditors 
appointed at the Ordinary Annual 
Meeting about the manner in which 
they should fulfil their responsibi­
lities. This reservation again reco­
gnizes the constitutional position 
and functions of the Comptroller 
and Auditor-General in securing 
the accountability of the executive 
in regard to the outgo of monies 
from the Consolidated Fund. The 
provision for the approval of the 
President to capital expenditure 
exceeding Rs. 10 lakhs and to 
appointments to posts on a maxi­
mum salary of Rs.2,000 and over is, 
however, questionable. If incor­
rectly used, it may result in politi­
cal interference and encroach­
ments on the autonomy of the com­
panies and may even affect their 
efficient operation and management. 
Though these reserve powers are 
important, they are not unreason­
able and, if applied in the manner 
intended, they should not inter­
fere with the autonomy of the 
companies. 

The processes antecedent to the 
establishment of an enterprise are 
important in their impact on the 
economics of production. While 
the determination of the industries 
to be developed and expanded and 
the targets to be reached, whether 
in the public or the private sector, 
is now a function of the Planning 
Commission, it is for the entre­
preneurs to decide upon the num­
ber and size of the production 
units, to select foreign associates 
where necessary, to settle the scope 
and terms of such association, and 
finally, to determine the location of 
the plant. These aspects of plan­
ning are as important as the 
arrangements for subsequent mana­
gement and operation of the units 
established. It would be stating the 
obvious that any lacuna in plan­
ning, in the selection of associates 
and location, would adversely affect 
their stability, efficiency and com­
petitive capacity. 

In the public sector, these res­
ponsibilities of promoters devolve 
upon the Ministry-in-charge of the 
industry concerned. The know­
ledge, maturity and experience 
needed for the adequate fulfilment 
of these responsibilities are, un­
fortunately, not always in evidence. 
The dispersal of the industries in 
several Ministries of Government 
comes in the way of providing for 
speciaJ.isation, for pooling of ex­
perience and for co-ordination of 
policy. It is common knowledge that 
the ship-building industry suffered 
a setback because the foreign asso­
ciates selected were unsuitable and 
also unequal to their task. It is also 
well-known that the Konar Dam, 
an important component of the 
Damodar Valley Corporation, cons­
tructed at a cost of over Rs. 11 
crores and "dedicated to the people 
of India" by the Prime Minister, 
has not generated one kilowatt of 
power or irrigated one acre of 
land; its utility as a flood control 
measure is also seriously in ques­
tion. It is perhaps not so well-



known that the production of steel 
in the public sector has been delay­
ed by over eighteen months as a 
result of indecision on the size of 
the Rourkela plant. The obvious 
decision to have a capacity of a 
million tons was taken only after 
detailed plans and estimates had 
been prepared for a half-a-million 
ton unit at considerable cost and 
effort. A comprehensive assess­
ment of the waste that has taken 
place of our limited resources as a 
result of faulty planning and exe­
cution would, I fear, present a 
staggering picture. 

The selection of efficient and 
knowledgeable associates of proved 
integrity is not enough by itself; 
the determination of the degree of 
association, advice and assistance 
needed is equally important. Till 
1955, the policy was to give the 
foreign associates, wherever they 
were needed, a financial stake in 
the industrial projects. It was 
considered that their participation 
in equity capital would secure eco­
nomic construction, adherence to 
target dates of completion and also 
subsequently the economic opera­
tion of installed capacity. There 
was no provision for the payment 
of any interest on the share capital 
and the associates had, therefore, to 
rely on the profits made by the 
companies for a return on the capi­
tal they had invested. This con­
tinued association and interest 
provided for the efficient operation 
t.f the production units; it also 
€ased the foreign exchange difficul­
ties. Our well-known deficiencies 
of competent technical personnel 
and of foreign exchange were thus 
substantially met by this policy. 
Additionally, it encouraged the 
1.ow much sought after foreign 
Plrticipation in India's economic 
de•elopment. Obviously, a review 
of tolicy is urgently called for. 

Th~ selection of a suitable loca­
tion :br a particular industrial unit 
has ~cessarily to be determined 

on economic consideration, on an 
examination of the availability of 
resources of raw materials, trans­
port and manpower locally, and its 
proximity to areas of consumption. 
But not unoften, political and even 
parochial considerations intervene, 
and these weighty and material 
considerations are brushed aside 
and the advice of technical and ad­
ministrative agencies ignored. If 
industrial development is to pro­
ceed on sound and economic lines, 
the location of industries should be 
d;etermined entirely on larger 
national interest, on the economics 
of production and distribution. 
There have been suggestions that 
the sites of the refineries in the 
Eastern zone were decided upon on 
political, rather than economic 
considerations. There was also, 
earlier, an unseemly controversy 
over the location of the steel plants. 
Any yielding to political and pro­
vincial pressure is not only detri­
mental to our economic develop­
ment on a competitive basis, but it 
also weakens the delicate fabric of 
our national unity. 

It is necessary now to examine 
how far the basic requirements of 
autonomy and accountability have, 
in practice, been realised in our ex­
panding field of State enterprises. 
Once planning and other prelimi­
naries for establishing a production 
unit have been settled, it is usual 
to entrust the residual work for its 
completion and subsequent opera­
tion to a Board of Directors. 
Initially, it was the policy to consti­
tute the Boards with a majority of 
senior officials, with a leavening of 
people with industrial and labour 
backgrounds. Neither elements had 
any financial or other interests in 
the efficiency and economy of 
operations. The contents of auto­
nomy came thus to be regu­
lated largely by the official block, 
not infrequently acting in accord­
ance with the wishes of their poli­
tical chiefs. The accustomed 
methods of departmental work and 
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regulations, the usual leisurely 
consideration of problems and their 
unimaginative treatment came to 
permeate and even dilute the auto­
nomy which was considered essen­
tial in public enterprises. The 
finance representative arrogated to 
himself, often, the right of veto 
through the provision for the reser­
vation of an item by the Chairman 
for the consideration of Govern­
ment. Non-officials, some wedded 
to the philosophy of private enter­
prise, were disinclined to make 
their weight felt in management. 
Sometimes decisions were taken by 
a committee of official Directors, 
and contracts concluded before 
they were reported to the Board for 
ratification. The experience and 
wisdom of the non-officials came, 
thus, to be lost in the conduct of 
the affairs of the concern. To give 
an example mentioned in the Audit 
Report of 1958, depreciated machi­
nery, originally costing Rs. 60 
lakhs, was hired by Hindustan Steel 
for a period of less than three years 
for a sum of Rs. 75 lakhs, Rs. 50 
lakhs as rental, Rs. 10 lakhs for 
spares and Rs. 15 lakhs for labour 
and supervision on repairs! A non­
official Director protested when the 
agreement already concluded was 
brought before the Board for con­
firmation-a voice in the wilder­
ness. The same audit report men­
tioned also a case of an award of a 
contract (at the instance of Govern­
ment by reason of all capital works 
costing Rs. 10 lakhs requiring 
Government approval), to a firm of 
contractors whose organisation, 
competence and technical know­
ledge to undertake a work of that 
magnitude were admittedly inade­
quate and whose integrity even was 
in question. Needless to say, assis­
tance on a massive scale and at 
considerable cost had to be afforded 
to the contractor to get the work 
executed, even though these heroic 
measures failed to secure comple­
tion within the time stipulated. 
Recently, the official as Chairman 
has been replaced in many of these 

companies by a non-official, but the 
basic composition has been left 
undisturbed. 

This brings me to a consideration 
of a weakness inherent in the 
organisation of State enterprises. 
While in a private enterprise, those 
in control have a direct and con­
tinuing interest on its efficient and 
economic management for a return 
on the money they have invested, 
there is no such incentive in a pub­
lic enterprise. Neither the official 
nor the non-official Directors have 
financial or any other stake in the 
concern. This is not to suggest 
that there is any dereliction of duty 
on their part, but to state an 
obvious positiOill. 

The issue of accountability is 
more complicated. Even in the 
United Kingdom, where the Mem­
bers of Parliament exercise a self­
imposed restraint in questions and 
debates on nationalised industries, 
it has been held: "Whereas parlia­
mentary control is more theoretical 
than actual, ministerial control is 
in practice more real than is pub­
licly admitted. By refraining from 
exercise of their directional powers 
over the Board and preferring to 
influence them through consulta­
tion, they (the Ministers) escape 
responsibility." This practice of 
evading responsibility has dimi­
nished public accountability to an 
extent not contemplated when the 
concept of autonomous manage­
ment was accepted. In India too, 
we have the classic example of the 
Life Insurance Corporation when 
its investments were influenced 
without recourse to a formal direc­
tive. 

In view of the increasing impor­
tance of public enterprises in our 
economy, the Congress Parlia~n­
tary Party appointed a sub-com­
mittee to study the questions of . 
autonomy and accountability in all 
their aspects and make suitable 
recommendations. The report of 



the sub-committee makes, indeed, 
strange reading. The central theme 
therein runs counter both to the 
concept of autonomy, as also of 
accountability. The sub-committee 
recommends that the Boards 
should, hereafter, be composed of 
permanent officials (mostly techni­
cal) drawn from the unit itself, 
with a Chairman named by the 
Minister with powers to over-ride 
the Board in all matters relating to 
management and control. A Board 
thus constituted will be no more 
than a committee of management. 
It will not have any of the attri­
butes of autonomy, nor will it have 
the benefit of wider knowledge 
and experience now available in 
the consideration of its problems. 
The sub-committee also assigns to 
the Minister an unusual and un­
accustomed role. In its own words, 
"apart from 'directives,' the Minis­
ter may and will give guidance 
from experience and from a correct 
appreciation of the constitutional 
issues. It does not appear to us the 
correct procedure to lay down the 
specific issues on which such guid­
ance may or may not be issued. 
The Government alone should, in 
the exercise of their responsibility, 
make this decision and also as to 
what kind of directive or other 
procedures should be followed. It 
may range from a letter to a talk 
of caution, a discussion, a removal, 
mild or otherwise". This would 
enlarge the functions of the Minis­
ter beyond his legitimate field of 
policy-making to the field of exe­
cutive administration. While 
strengthening his control, it would 
diminish parliamentary control to 
a corresponding extent. By shelte­
ring behind a facade of autonomy, 
the Minister will escape accountabi-

lity even though his control over 
these undertakings will be no less 
pervading than over his Ministry, 
for which he is fully accountable. 
In the ultimate analysis, the recom­
mendations are a negation of the 
accepted and well-understood con­
cepts of autonomy and accountabi­
lity. 

It may not be out of place to 
suggest, on the basis of this ana­
lysis, a possible solution. When 
foreign assistance is necessary, the 
company should appropriately be 
organised with a mixed ownership. 
The foreign associates should be 
allowed participation in equities to 
the extent of approximately 25 per 
cent and given a share in manage­
ment. Another 25 per cent of the 
equity capital should be made 
available for public subscription. 
(This has been recommended by the 
Estimates Committee in 1955). The 
public investors should also have a 
proportionate representation on the 
Board. While the State should 
have the controlling financial inte­
rest and also controlling represen­
tation on the Board, it will have the 
benefit of foreign investment easing 
foreign exchange difficulties, 
technical assistance in management 
which is now deficient, and public 
investment and participation in 
management which will make it 
broader based. This re-orientation 
of policy should bring greater rea­
lism in planning, competence and 
wider interest in management and 
should lastly generate public confi­
dence in the ability of the State 
enterprises to make a significant 
contribution towards building a 
new India, industrially strong and 
economically viable. 

The views expressed in this leaflet do not necessaril!i 
represent the views of the Fon1m of Free Enterprise. 

Reproduced with the kind permission of the editor from "Industrial India" Annual, 
1960. (Pub: M/s A. MacRae & Co. Pvt. Ltd .. United India Bldg., Sir P.M. Road, 

Bombay I) 
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With best compliments of: 

Forum of Free Enterprise 
235 Dr. Dadabhai Naoroji Road, Bombay r 

HAVE YOU JOINED THE 
FORUM? 

Annual membership fee is Rs. 10/­
only. 
Bona Fide students can get our 
literature for a year by becoming 
student associates on payment of 
Rs. 2/- only. 
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